
From: Mervyn Yan mervyn.yan@gmail.com
Subject: Re: Mervyn please wire--

Date: September 25, 2018 at 1:28 PM
To: Hunter Biden hbiden@rosemontseneca.com
Cc: Jim Biden jbiden@lionhallgp.com

Will try today.

Are you in the city tomorrow? I can go see you in DC/Philadelphia/DE this Thursday if you can’t make it.

Thanks,
Mervyn

On Tue, Sep 25, 2018 at 13:08 Hunter Biden <hbiden@rosemontseneca.com> wrote:
Please wire to my Owasco PC account the remaining two monthgkly draws minus the 35K adv once I took last week.  So
$295,000.00 today.  Then please give men detailed bank statements of what is left in the account after you’ve taken your final two
draws.  We then need two discuss what we owe and to whom and determine what of any money is left for disbursement. Then we
can unwind in an orderly way as soon was poswswible.  Thank You, Hunter
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